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Through analysing references to legal education in New Zealand fiction this article highlights and critiques some of the 
most important issues facing legal educators. The various challenges that students experience in their journeys through 
legal education are reflected in fictional texts. More often than not, these reflections, or imaginings, are impressively 
accurate, especially when analysed in the context of contemporary legal education scholarship. The interplay between 
pedagogical research and fictional representations facilitates fascinating discussions as to why students choose to learn 
law, how legal teaching affects them and what are the relative experiences of elite and non-elite students. The findings in 
this article are based on a comprehensive study of New Zealand legal fiction and provide an alternative informational 
source for those who are interested in analysing, and those who are striving to improve, how we teach law in New 
Zealand.  

"Devils Down Under: Perceptions of Lawyers' Ethics in New Zealand Fiction"  

(2013) 44 VUWLR 609 
Victoria University of Wellington Legal Research Paper No. 145/2014 

 

http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=2029332&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
mailto:allegra.crawford@vuw.ac.nz
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=1772341&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
mailto:laura.lincoln@vuw.ac.nz
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=115459&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
mailto:john.prebble@vuw.ac.nz
http://www.ssrn.com/link/Victoria-U-Wellington-LEG.html
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#managesub
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#publisher
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#directors
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://www.ssrn.com/update/forms/absubmission.html&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#paper_2433851
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=115456&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=1692190&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#paper_2421158
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=115456&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/ViewIssue.cfm?JI=1865415&I=33&V=4&T=CMBO&redirectFrom=true#top
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/papers.cfm?abstract_id=2433851&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/PIP_Journal.cfm?pip_jrnl=1864782&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=115456&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
mailto:Grant.Morris@vuw.ac.nz
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/cf_dev/AbsByAuth.cfm?per_id=1692190&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
mailto:kymi_lewis@hotmail.com
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/papers.cfm?abstract_id=2421158&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e
http://hq.ssrn.com/Journals/RedirectClick.cfm?url=http://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/PIP_Journal.cfm?pip_jrnl=1864782&partid=%3c%3cPART_ID%3e%3e&did=%3c%3cDELIVERY_ID%3e%3e&eid=%3c%3cEMAIL_ID%3e%3e


GRANT HAMILTON MORRIS, Victoria University of Wellington - Faculty of Law 
Email: Grant.Morris@vuw.ac.nz 

Sophisticated fictional portrayals of lawyers facing ethical dilemmas can provide important insights into the nature of legal 
ethics and morality in the New Zealand legal profession. These insights can assist the legal community in addressing 
complex issues surrounding professional regulation. This article reveals legal characters who act contrary to legal ethics 
but with moral justifications and characters who act ethically but in a way that laypeople may view as amoral or immoral. 
While the depictions of lawyers are generally negative, a close analysis reveals that this is partly a result of confusion 
over what Dare has termed the standard conception of a lawyer's role. Fewer insights can be gained from superficial 
characterisations. While much has been written on this topic in other jurisdictions, more light can be shed on New 
Zealand's ethical landscape through the study of New Zealand's fictional texts. This article exposes a rich resource for the 
legal community because as Economides and O'Leary have argued in relation to legal ethics, stories matter. This dictum 
should apply to works of non-fiction and fiction.  
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The School is close to New Zealand's Parliament, courts, and the headquarters of government departments. Throughout 
Victoria's history, our law teachers have contributed actively to policy formation and to law reform. As a result, in addition to 
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